IN-CAR VIDEO SYSTEMS & ZOOM CAMERAS - SHERIFF
FUNDING — SHERIFF’S FLEET

(Request for Bid sent to thirteen vendors)

RFB #03-13648

Mobile Vision Kustom Signals Kustom Signals Decatur
(Option 1) (Option 2) Electronics
5 ea. Industrial Grade In- ($3,390.00 ea.) ($3,209.00 ea.) ($3,409.00 ea.) ($1,800.00 ea.)
Car Video Systems $16,950.00 $16,045.00 $17,045.00 $9,000.00
Kustom Signal Kustom Signal Decatur Gemini
Brand/Model Mobile Vision 7 Patrol Cam Eye Witness 2 Legacy
3 ea. Color Cameras, low ($249.00 ea.) ($250.00 ea.)
light, optical/digital zoom. $747.00 No Bid $750.00
Brand/Model Mobile Vision Sony EVI-
MV-C300E 400CCD
Grand total $17,697.00 $16,045.00 $17,045.00 $9,750.00
Delivery Date 30 days 45 days ARO 7 days
Pricing guaranteed year 2? Yes Yes No
Pricing guaranteed year 3? Yes No No
McCoy’s Law Eagleye Custom Fit Prosecutor of
Line Technologies Texas
5 ea. Industrial Grade In- ($3,475.00 ea.) ($3,400.00 ea.) ($3,827.00 ea.) ($3,065.00 ea.)
Car Video Systems $17,375.00 $17,000.00 $19,135.00 $15,325.00
Stalker Vision Prosecutor 2000
Brand/Model I-Trak Eagleye 800 VHS
3 ea. Color Cameras, low ($801.00 ea.) ($485.00 ea.)
light, optical/digital zoom. No Bid No Bid $2,403.00 $1,455.00
Brand/Model CFI/Sanyo TRINUS PCC-1N
Grand total $17,375.00 $17,000.00 $21,538.00 $16,780.00
Delivery Date 15 days 30 days ARO 30 days ARO 30 days ARO
Pricing guaranteed year 2? Yes Yes No Yes
Pricing guaranteed year 3? Yes Yes No Yes
MPH Industries IBM Sharp
5 ea. Industrial Grade In- ($3,059.00 ea.) ($5,790.00 ea.)
Car Video Systems $15,295.00 $28,950.00 No Bid
Brand/Model MPH Docucam V Coban Top Cam 120020

3 ea. Color Cameras, low

($595.00 ea.)

($675.00 ea.)

light, optical/digital zoom. $1,785.00 $2,025.00

Brand/Model MPH Docucam V Sony EB2201-CMR
camera

Grand total $17,080.00 $30,975.00

Delivery Date 30 days 2 weeks

Pricing guaranteed year 27 Yes No

Pricing guaranteed year 3? Yes No
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