APPROVED DECEMBER 4, 2006

DVR EQUIPMENT & INSTALLATION for the JUVENILE RESIDENTIAL FACILITY - JUVENILE RESIDENTIAL

FACILITY

FUNDING - JUVENILE RESIDENTIAL FACILITY

(Request for Bids sent to forty-six vendors)

RFB 06-0153
Cytek Global Markertek Sandifer Sandifer BioMet BioMet Smith Audio
Media | Government/ Engineering | Engineering Access Access Visual
Systems Education & Controls, Option 1 Option 1
Solutions Inc
1. 18 ea, Color Day/Night 480 Line Camera No bid No bid No bid $184.00 ea $1,541.00 ea | $142.00 ea $1,985.00 $220.00 ea
$3,312.00 Pan/Tilt/Zoom $2,556.00 Pan/Tilt/Zoom $3,960.00
550 Line camera
2. 18 ea, 2.8-12mm DC A/l Vari-Focal Lens No bid No bid No bid $69.00 ea No bid $51.00 ea No bid $115.00 ea
$1,242.00 $918.00 $2,070.00
3.5¢ea, STI CCTV Camera Housing with No bid No bid No bid $86.25 2/ea No bid $88.00 ea No bid $150.00 ea
enclosure. Heater & Blower $172.50 $440.00 $750.00
4.1 ea, DVXI SM 32 Channel, 500 GB No bid No bid No bid $6,227.25 No bid $7,300.00 No bid $6,300.00
Hard Drive
5. 1 ea, 18 Gauge Unshielded Stranded No bid No bid No bid $58.08 No bid $149.00 No bid $500.00
Cable & Conduit, plenum Rated for Fired
6. 1 ea, RG6/U 18 Gauge Coaxial Plenum No bid No bid No bid $132.82 No bid $515.00 No bid $1,500.00
Rated for Fire
7.1 ea, Labor & Installation No bid No bid No bid $3,240.00 No bid $4,700.00 No bid $6,525.00
8. 1 ea, Warranty No bid No bid No bid $1,246.95 No bid $800.00 No bid $600.00
9. Power Supply $161.00 $190.00
16 output power
LCD Color Monitor (for DVR) $273.70
Total $16,066.30 $19,363.00 $22,395.00
Delivery Date 1/31/2007 12/18/2006 30 days ARO
Timeline for Completion 30 days One week 5 days
Addendum Acknowledged Y Y Y

The recommendation of Purchasing and the Juvenile Residential Facility is to accept the low bid from Sandifer Engineering &

Controls, Inc. in the amount of $16,066.30.




