
BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS APRIL 23, 2009

     RFB 09-0117  Req 10038016

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
1.  CAT6Plus Plenum, PN 
#HITACHI 30025-8-YE-2 or 
Equal

65000 sq 
ft $240.00/M $15,600.00 $255.68/M $16,619.20 $242.3913/M $15,755.43 $0.25 $16,250.00 $242.21/M $15,743.65

2.  CAT6 Yellow Keystone 
Jacks, PN #Superior KJ458-
C6-YE or Leviton 61110-Y6 350 ea $2.45 $857.50 $6.51 $2,278.50 $4.58 $1,601.63 $2.16 $756.00 $2.51 $878.50
3.  2 Port Ivory Keystone 
Plates, PN #Superior 
FPKS0200 200 ea $0.80 $160.00 No Bid $0.92 $184.80 $0.48 $96.00 $0.85 $170.00
4.  2 Port Furniture Plates, PN 
#Leviton 49910-S62 50 ea $1.85 $92.50 $2.31 $115.50 $1.64 $81.95 $2.16 $108.00 $3.15 $157.50
5.  48 Port CAT6 Patch Panel, 
PN #Superior 
DCC4888/110SIX or Leviton 
69586-U48 8 ea $225.00 $1,800.00 $327.08 $2,616.64 $237.26 $1,898.09 $271.76 $2,174.08 $158.32 $1,266.56

6.  1U Horizontal Wire 
Mgmnt, PN #Superior CM101 
or Leviton 49253LCM 1 ea $18.75 $18.75 $29.13 $29.13 $20.75 $20.75 $26.56 $26.56 $18.56 $18.56

7.  2U Horizontal Wire 
Mgmnt, PN #Superior CM103 
or Leviton 49253BCM 9 ea $25.15 $226.35 $42.12 $379.08 $30.31 $272.80 $38.41 $345.69 $25.15 $226.35

8.  7' Black Rack, PN #Damac 
RRA19084-3 or equal 3 ea $105.75 $317.25 No Bid $101.71 $305.14 $128.61 $385.83 $104.60 $313.80

Qty
Anixter, Inc Kriz-Davis Co. Midwest Electrical Supply

Stanion Wholesale Electric 
Co.

Conference Technologies 
Inc.

4.  ELECTRICAL & DATA CABLING PARTS -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT/APPRAISER'S OFFICE
     FUNDING -- APPRAISER ADMINISTRATION
     (Request for Bid sent to twenty-four vendors)



BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS APRIL 23, 2009

9.  Vertical Wire Mgmnt-
Double Sided, PN #Damac 
MRS084W-3 or equal 4 ea $240.00 $960.00 No Bid $264.86 $1,059.43 $90.88 $363.52 $239.07 $956.28

10.  Horizontal Power Panels, 
PN #Superior PS115 3 ea $87.40 $262.20 No Bid $75.30 $225.89 $340.90 $1,022.70 $89.46 $268.38
11.  10' Black Ladder Rack, 
PN #Damac PLR1210-3 or 
equal 12 ea $54.00 $648.00 No Bid $55.49 $665.93 $82.08 $984.96 $54.02 $648.24
12.  Wall Triangel Support, 
PN #Damac PLBWT12-3 or 
equal 36 ea $37.95 $1,366.20 No Bid $37.78 $1,360.00 $20.95 $754.20 $13.22 $475.92
13.  2" Cable Support Clip, 
PN #ERI CAT32 or equal 200 ea $135.50/C $271.00 No Bid $215.24/C $430.48 $2.50 $500.00 $229.68/C $459.36
14.  4" Cable Support Clip, 
PN #ERI CAT64 or equal 200 ea $4.60 $920.00 No Bid $408.19/C $816.37 $4.16 $832.00 $430.62/C $861.24
15.  Drywall Bracket, PN 
#ERI MPLS or equal 200 ea $1.25 $250.00 No Bid $122.65/C $245.31 $1.48 $296.00 $123.62/C $247.24
16.  Wall Angle Support Kit, 
PN #Damac PLBWA12-3 or 
equal 3 ea $13.20 $39.60 No Bid $13.13 $39.39 $20.93 $62.79 $13.22 $39.66

$23,789.35 $22,038.05 $24,963.39 $24,958.33 $22,731.24Grand total
Days for delivery 20 days 4 days10 days

On the recommendation of Kandace Johnson, behalf of the Facilities Department and Appraiser's Office, Ron Estes moved to accept the low complete bid from Midwest Electrical 
Supply Co. in the amount of $22,731.24.  Irene Hart seconded the motion.  The motion passed unanimously.

These parts are for wiring and cabling of workstations and computer equipment in addition to the relocation of the Appraiser's Office at the Harry Street Mall, located at 3805 E. Harry.  
Installation and labor will be bid separately and completed by an electrical company, in-house staff cannot provide labor as this is a leased facility.

This list of items is for data cabling to support the Appraiser’s Office computers and phones and includes; phone jacks, patch panels, racks, support clips, face plates and cable.  Our 
technology staff determined the equipment needed.

Question: Who is doing the cabling installation?  County does not have enough resources available (internal labor) to do the work, therefore, the labor will be bid separately.  
Question: Does the $22,731.24 fit in with the estimated project cost?  Yes

M = thousand
C = hundred


