
BOARD OF BIDS CONTRACTS MAY 28, 2009

        RFB 09-0142  Req 10037709

Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost
1.  100 gal, Dow Agrosciences, 

Tordon 22k in one gallon 

containers 100 $93.49 $9,349.00 no bid no bid $94.47 $9,447.00 $94.47 $9,447.00

2.  600 lbs, Drexel (80% 

Diuron or comparable product 600

$3.55          

Alternate, 

Karmex SP $2,130.00 $3.44 $2,064.00 $3.95 $2,370.00 $3.24 $1,944.00 $3.24 $1,944.00

3.  540 gal, Riverdal 

Weedestroy (AM-40 or 

comparable product) 540

$11.45               

    Alternate 

Clean Amine $6,183.00 $11.39 $6,150.60 $14.05 $7,587.00

$11.47        

Alternate, 

Cornbelt 2.4-

D Amine $6,193.80

$11.47                  

       

Alternate, 

Cornbelt 2, 4- $6,193.80
4.  50 gal, B.A.S.F. Habitat or 

comparable product in 2.5 

gallon containers 50 $159.50 $7,975.00 $95.00 $4,750.00 $105.25 $5,262.50 $69.97 $3,498.50 $69.97 $3,498.50

5.  1,440 lbs, SSI Maxim Top 

Site in 40 lb pails 1,440 $2.21 $3,182.40 $2.44 $3,513.60 no bid $2.27 $3,268.80 $2.27 $3,268.80

6.  1,000 lbs, B.A.S.F. Sahara 

in 10 lb bags 1,000 $8.95 $8,950.00 ***$8.60 $8,600.00 no bid $8.79 $8,790.00

$7.39     

Alternate, 

Mohave 70 

EG 10X5 $7,390.00

$37,769.40 $25,078.20 $15,219.50 $33,142.10 $31,742.10

Delivery date 2-3 days ARO

10 days from receipt of PO; 

***BASF is currently out of 

10 lb package size until 

6/19/09; Sahara to be 

supplied in 40 lb bag until 

then 7 days ARO

DeAngelo Brothers, Inc

Vegetation Management 

Supply, Inc

1-2 days; Item four 

available in quarts

1-2 days; Item four 

available in quarts

Van Diest Supply Co

Van Diest Supply Co, 

Option 2

Total

Qty

Crop Production Services

1.   WEED CHEMICALS -- NOXIOUS WEEDS

      FUNDING - NOXIOUS WEEDS

      (Request for Bid sent to sixteen [16] vendors)



BOARD OF BIDS CONTRACTS MAY 28, 2009

Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost
1.  100 GAL, Dow 

Agrosciences, Tordon 22k in 

one gallon containers 100 no bid no bid $130.00 $13,000.00 $95.00 $9,500.00 $89.79 $8,979.00

2.  600 lbs, Drexel (80% 

Diuron or comparable product 600

$3.35     

Alternate, 

Diuron 80 

DF 5 lb or 

25 lb $2,010.00 $9.01 $5,406.00

$3.80         

Alternate, 

Alligare $2,280.00

$3.55      

Alternate, 

Karmex $2,130.00 $3.99 $2,394.00

3.  540 gal, Riverdal 

Weedestroy (AM-40 or 

comparable product 540 no bid no bid $14.40 $7,776.00 $11.85 $6,399.00

$13.78        

Alternate, 2, 

4-D Nufarm 

4h $7,441.20

4.  50 gal, B.A.S.F. Habitat or 

comparable product in 2.5 

gallon containers 50

$79.00          

Alternate, 

Ecomazapyr 

2SL $3,950.00 no bid $159.50 $7,975.00 $68.50 $3,425.00

$71.49             

  Alternate, 

Polaris $3,574.50

5.  1,440 lbs, SSI Maxim Top 

Site in 40 lb pails 1,440 no bid no bid $2.48 $3,571.20 $2.45 $3,528.00 $2.29 $3,297.60

6.  1,000 lbs, B.A.S.F. Sahara 

in 10 lb bags 1,000

$8.00            

Alternate, 

Mojave 7089 

in 5lb or 25 

lb bags $8,000.00 no bid $8.73 $8,730.00 $8.92 $8,920.00 $9.65 $9,650.00

$13,960.00 $5,406.00 $43,332.20 $33,902.00 $35,336.30

Sorelle, Inc

Total

Delivery date 4-5 business days ARO 7-10 days ARO 5 days 3-7 days ARO within 5 days of order

Qty

Alligare, LLC Lesco, Inc CWC Chemical Red River Specialties

On the recommendation of Joe Thomas on behalf of Noxious Weeds, Jennifer Dombaugh moved to accept the low responsible bid for item no.1 for $9,349.00 

from Crop Production Services and the low bids for item nos.2 and 6 for $9,334.00 from Van Diest Supply Co.(Option 2), item no.3 for $6,150.60 from 

Vegetation Management Supply, Inc., item no.4 for $3,425.00 from Red River Specialties, and item no.5 for $3,182.40 from Crop Production Services, for 

an initial total purchase of $31,441.00 and execute contract pricing for one (1) year.  Ron Estes Seconded the motion.  The motion carried unanimously.

Environmental standards are being met by our vendors for weed chemicals.  Each vendor is required to meet local, state, and federal regulations in regards to the sale 

and distribution of these products.  The vendors also supply the County with MSDS (Material Safety Data Sheets) and Worker Protection Labels for safety and 

cleanup purposes.

Note: Sorelle, Inc. was originally the low bidder for item no.1, however, in discussion with the vendor and noting that their pricing was lower than other vendors, it 

was discovered that a nonjudgmental error had occurred. Based on statute (K.S.A. 75-6904), this bid has been withdrawn.

  


