
BID OPENING JUNE 24, 2014

2.  TOXICOLOGY INSTRUMENTATION -- SEDGWICK COUNTY FORENSIC SCIENCE CENTER

     FUNDING -- SEDGWICK COUNTY FORENSIC SCIENCE CENTER

     (Request sent to 164 vendors) 

     RFB #14-0052

Option 1
PerkinElmer Health 

Sciences, Inc.

QA Group, LLC 

dba Quantum 

Analytics

Agilent 

Technologies, Inc.

Thermo Electron 

North America, 

LLC

Manufacturer and model
PerkinElmer Clarus 

580 GC

Agilent 7890B 

(refurbished)

Agilent 7890B + 

Column

Thermo Scientific-

Trace 1310

1. Gas Chromatograph $17,089.00 $15,004.57 $16,209.20 $13,027.71

2. Headspace unit $18,818.25 $20,164.40 $23,134.30 $20,385.00

3. PC bundle $1,994.40 $10,093.50 $9,623.60 $2,085.00

4. LaserJet printer $506.00 included included $515.00

5. License included $2,669.40 included $1,540.00

6. Installation fee $1,500.00 $734.40 included included

7. Shipping and handling $607.05 included included $325.00

Option 1 total $40,514.70 $48,666.27 $48,967.10 $37,877.71

Option 2

Manufacturer and model

PerkinElmer 

Turbomatrix 

Headspace Sampler

Agilent 7697A 

(refurbished)

Agilent 7697A + 

LAN + Column
no bid

1. Headspace unit for current GC $19,240.25 $20,164.40 $24,386.60 no bid

2. PC bundle $2,181.00 $10,093.50 $10,635.10 no bid

3. LaserJet printer $506.00 included included no bid

4. License included $2,669.40 included no bid

5. Installation fee $800.00 $1,028.70 included no bid

6. Shipping and handling $443.89 included included no bid

Option 2 total $23,171.14

$35,271.80 

(including LAN kit 

and column for 

current GC)

$35,021.70 no bid

Extended warranty for Option 1 $4,572.00 $3,499.80 $3,146.40 $4,085.00

Extended warranty for Option 2 $2,616.00
$9,564.00 (includes 

current GC)
$3,168.00 no bid

Days for delivery 35 days 7-10 days 3-4 weeks ARO 30-45 days ARO

Ampronix, Inc.
Hicks-Ashby 

Company
AB SCIEX Life-Assist, Inc.

Serological 

Research Institute

Mortech 

Manufacturing, Inc.

Dynatronics 

Corporation

Albrayco 

Technologies, Inc.

Laerdal Medical Carstens, Inc.
Bay Medical 

Company, Inc.

BioTek 

Instruments, Inc.

Quadmed, Inc. PharmaJet DRE, Inc.
Electra-Med 

Corporation

Troy Biologicals
Bound Tree 

Medical

Claflin Medical 

Equipment

Innovative 

Laboratory 

Systems, Inc.

Feld Fire VWR International

No Bid

Axygen, a Corning Brand


