
BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS OCTOBER 3, 2013

1.  TRIPLE COMBINATION PUMPER FIRE APPARATUSES - SEDGWICK COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT #1

     FUNDING - FIRE DIST. ADMIN

     (Request sent to 30 vendors)

      RFP #  13-0081 Shopping Cart # 8000023944

Qty

Triple Comb. Pump. Fire 

App. 1 $426,654.00 $426,654.00 $423,855.00 $423,855.00 $400,008.00 $400,008.00 $396,730.00 $396,730.00

Triple Comb. Pump. Fire 

App. 1 $426,654.00 $426,654.00 $499,855.00 $499,855.00 $400,008.00 $400,008.00 $396,730.00 $396,730.00

Manuals 2 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Dual Agent Foam 2 $3,177.00 $6,354.00 $8,200.00 $16,400.00

CAFS 2 $23,463.00 $46,926.00 $59,845.00 $119,690.00 $27,000.00 $54,000.00

$906,588.00 $940,110.00* $919,706.00 $847,460.00

Additional Triple Comb. 

Pump. Fire App. 1 $426,654.00 $426,654.00 $449,855.00 $395,855.00 $400,008.00 $400,008.00 $408,864.00 $408,864.00

Dual Agent Foam 1 $3,177.00 $3,177.00 $8,200.00 $8,200.00

CAFS 1 $23,463.00 $23,463.00 $59,845.00 $59,845.00 $27,000.00 $27,000.00

Manuals 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$453,294.00 $404,055.00* $459,853.00 $435,864.00

$1,359,882.00 $1,344,165.00* $1,379,559.00 $1,283,324.00

NO BID

included w/CAFS

included w/CAFS

NO BID

GRAND TOTAL

included

60-90 days

included

90 days ARO 300 days

TOTAL (Initial Purchase)

Delivery

TOTAL (Additional Purchase)

Max Fire Apparatus**

360 days

ITEMS REQUIRING BOCC APPROVAL

1 ITEM

Pierce Manufacturing, Inc.

Rosenbauer Minnesota 

Division, LLC Sutphen Corporation

Alexis Fire Equipment 

Company

Pierce Manufacturing, Inc.

Sutphen Corporation*

Alexis Fire Equipment 

CompanyManufacturer



BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS OCTOBER 3, 2013

Qty

Danko

Hackney 

Emergency 

Vehicles

Triple Comb. Pump. Fire 

App. 1 $363,353.00 $363,353.00 $395,571.00 $395,571.00 $411,604.00 $411,604.00

Triple Comb. Pump. Fire 

App. 1 $363,353.00 $363,353.00 $422,317.00 $422,317.00 $421,000.00 $421,000.00

Manuals 2 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Dual Agent Foam 2 $3,170.00 $6,340.00

CAFS 2 $36,400.00 $72,800.00

$805,846.00 $817,888.00* $832,604.00*

Additional Triple Comb. 

Pump. Fire App. 1 $363,353.00 $363,353.00 $410,949.00 $410,949.00

Dual Agent Foam 1 $3,170.00 $3,170.00

CAFS 1 $36,400.00 $36,400.00

Manuals 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$402,923.00 $410,949.00* $0.00

GRAND TOTAL $1,208,769.00 $1,228,837.00* $832,604.00*

** Delivery does not meet requirement

NO BID

Delivery 11/30/2013 30 days 90-120 days

NO BID

NO BID

On the recommendation of Gunda Angelica, on behalf of Sedgwick County Fire District #1, Linda Kizzire moved to accept the proposal from Pierce 

Manufacturing, Inc., for two (2) Triple Combination Pumper Fire Apparatuses in the amount of $847,460.00, with the option to purchase the third 

apparatus in the amount of $435,864.00, for a grand total of $1,283,324.00.  David Spears seconded the motion.  The motion passed unanimously. 

NO BID

A committee comprised of Craig Leu, Doug Williams, Alfred Pressnell, Stewart Segraves, Brian Richey, Darin House, Raymond Hensley, Troy Hilger, Anthony 

Tracy, Tom Richardson, Mark Voges, Spencer Dean, Tony Dreasher, Todd Nix, Jeff Cowley, Christopher Roberts, Jeremiah, Christophersen, Calvin Flores from 

Sedgwick County Fire District #1, and Gunda Angelica from purchasing, evaluated all proposal responses based on experience, qualifications, and ability to do the 

work and all parties unanimously approved Pierce Manufacturing Inc's proposal with the Compressed Air Foam System (CAFS) option.  Pierce Manufacturing Inc. 

most closely meets the minimum design and requirements requested.  Pierce Manufacturing's apparatuses offer savings in maintenance in both material and labor 

costs.  These are replacement vehicles, old apparatuses will be sold on Purplewave.

* Total Price Incomplete, No CAFS Option

TOTAL (Additional Purchase)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BIDNO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Ferrara Fire Apparatus, Inc. Emergency Fire Equipment* Weis Fire & Safety*

Manufacturer Ferrara Fire Apparatus, Inc. Spartan ERV E-One

TOTAL (Initial Purchase)


