
BID OPENING MARCH 13, 2018

1.  SHERIFF'S OFFICE AMMUNITION - SHERIFF OFFICE
     FUNDING -  SHERIFF OFFICE
     (Request sent to 13  vendors)

     RFB #18-0002

Duty Ammunition Alternate 
Ammunation 

Unit of Measure 
Quantity per Case

Price Per Stated 
UOM

Alternate 
Ammunation 

Unit of Measure 
Quantity per Case

Price Per 
Stated UOM

Unit of Measure 
Quantity per Case

Price Per 
Stated 
UOM

1.   Speer Gold Dot 124 Grain +P 9MM RA9BA  500 RD/CASE $169.98 CCI-53617  1,000 RD / Case $435.59 1,000 RD / Case $296.00
2.   Federal Tactical Rifle Urban 55 grain BTHP .223 T223E No Bid $0.00 500 RD / Case $333.33 500 RD / Case $234.00
3.   Winchester 12 Gauge 1 oz. segmented slug RA12RS15S 250 RD/CASE $142.50 N/A $0.00 No Bid $0.00

Practice Ammunition Unit of Measure 
Quantity per Case

Price Per Stated 
UOM

Unit of Measure 
Quantity per Case

Unit of Measure 
Quantity per Case

Price Per 
Stated 
UOM

1.   9mm 124 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass USA9MM 500 RD/CASE $89.15 CCI-53651  1,000 RD / Case $241.44 1,000 RD / Case $172.00
2.   .223 55 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass USA223R1 1,000 RD/CASE $301.20 FC-AE223BK  1,000 RD / Case $346.74 500 RD / Case $146.00
3.   12 Gauge Bird shot 7 1/2  2 3/4" TRGTL127 250 RD/CASE $57.00 FC-TGL12 7.5  250 RD / Case $44.05 250 RD / Case $49.00
4.   Estimated Delivery time 
      Acknowledge Addendum

Duty Ammunition Unit of Measure 
Quantity per Case

Price Per Stated 
UOM

1.   Speer Gold Dot 124 Grain +P 9MM 500 RD / Case $181.19
2.   Federal Tactical Rifle Urban 55 grain BTHP .223 T223E 200 RD / Case $74.48
3.   Winchester 12 Gauge 1 oz. segmented slug RA12RS15S 250 RD / Case $104.53

Practice Ammunition Unit of Measure 
Quantity per Case

Price Per Stated 
UOM

1.   9mm 124 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass 500 RD / Case $86.80 AC9-4N  
2.   .223 55 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass 500 RD / Case $149.19 AC223-1N  
3.   12 Gauge Bird shot 7 1/2  2 3/4" 250 RD / Case $49.04 #50135  
4.   Estimated Delivery time 
      Acknowledge Addendum

No Bid

Y Y Y

Salt Lake Wholesale Sports The Hunting Shack Inc.

Y

Price Per Stated UOM

30-90 Days

Price Per Stated UOM

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$169.00

90-120 Days

Armscor Cartridge Inc.

30 Days
N

No Bid
No Bid

Unit of Measure Quantity per Case

1,000 RD / Case
1,000 RD / Case
1,000 RD / Case

$265.00
$300.00

Precision Delta Corporation G T Distributors, Inc.

Kiesler Police Supply

Accuracy Inc. dba Ultramax 
Ammunition

Unit of Measure Quantity per Case

No Bid

30-120 Days 90 Days ARO


	18-0002

