BOCC APPROVAL MAY 9, 2018
BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MAY 3, 2018

5. AMMUNITION -- SHERIFF'S OFFICE
FUNDING -- SHERIFF'S OFFICE
(Request sent to 13 vendors)

RFB #18-0002 Contract

Precision Delta Corporation

G T Distributors, Inc.

Accuracy Inc. dba Ultramax
Ammunition

Duty Ammunition

Estimated Unit of Measure | Price Per Stated |  Unit of Measure Price Per Stated | Unit of Measure | Price Per Stated
Usage Quantity per Case UoM Quantity per Case UOM Quantity per Case UoM
10,000 rounds
1. Speer Gold Dot 124 Grain +P 9MM every two 500 rds/case $169.98 1,000 rds/case $435.59 1,000 rds/case $296.00
years
. . . 6,000 rounds .
2. Federal Tactical Rifle Urban 55 grain BTHP .223 T223E every 2 years No Bid 500 rds/case $333.33 500 rds/case $234.00
3. Winchester 12 Gauge 1 oz. segmented slug RA12RS15S 1‘2;;? ;g;r;ds 250 rds/case $142.50 N/A No Bid
Practice Ammunition
Estimated Unit of Measure Price Per Stated Unit of Measure Price Per Stated Unit of Measure Price Per Stated
Usage Quantity per Case UOM Quantity per Case UOM Quantity per Case UOM
175,000
1. 9mm 124 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass rounds per 500 rds/case $89.15 1,000 rds/case $241.44 1,000 rds/case $172.00
year
. 87,000 rounds
2. .223 55 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass per year 1,000 rds/case $301.20 1,000 rds/case $346.74 500 rds/case $146.00
3. 12 Gauge Bird shot 7 1/2 2 3/4" 500 r;‘égfs PEMl 250 rds/case $57.00 250 rds/case $44.05 250 rds/case $49.00
Estimated delivery time 30-120 Days 90 Days ARO 90-120 Days
Acknowledge addendum Y Y Y
Kiesler Police Supply Armscor Cartridge Inc.
Duty Ammunition
Estimated Unit of Measure Price Per Stated Unit of Measure Price Per Stated
Usage Quantity per Case UOM Quantity per Case UOM
10,000 rounds
1. Speer Gold Dot 124 Grain +P 9MM every two 500 rds/case $181.19 No Bid
years
. . . 6,000 rounds .
2. Federal Tactical Rifle Urban 55 grain BTHP .223 T223E 200 rds/case $74.48 No Bid
every 2 years
3. Winchester 12 Gauge 1 oz. segmented slug RA12RS15S 1‘2;;? ;Zi?ds 250 rds/case $104.53 No Bid
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Practice Ammunition

Estimated Unit of Measure Price Per Stated Unit of Measure | Price Per Stated
Usage Quantity per Case UOM Quantity per Case uoM
175,000
1. 9mm 124 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass rounds per 500 rds/case $86.80 1,000 rds/case $169.00
year
2. 22355 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass 87'82?;;’;”"5 500 rds/case $149.19 1,000 rds/case $265.00
3. 12 Gauge Bird shot 7 1/2 2 3/4" 500 r;’/‘égfs PEMl 250 rds/case $49.04 1,000 rds/case $300.00
Estimated delivery time 30-90 Days 30 Days
Acknowledge addendum Y Y

No Bid

Salt Lake Wholesale Sports

The Hunting Shack Inc.

On the recommendation of Paul Regehr, on behalf of The Sheriff's Office, Ellen House moved to accept the bid for duty ammunition from Accuracy Inc. dba Ultramax Ammunition
for Items 1 and 2, and from Precision Delta Corporation for Item 3, and the low overall bid for practice ammunition from Armscor Cartridge Inc., and establish contract
pricing for two (2) years with two (2) one (1) year options to renew at the rates listed. Linda Kizzire seconded the motion. The motion passed 4 to 1 with Richard Powell abstaining,

as his office will utilize the contract.

Kiesler Police Supply bid alternates made by Remington Arms Company, LLC which has recently filed for bankruptcy. For this reason they were not considered for award.

Total cost was determined using annual usage estimates. In 2017, The Sheriff's Office spent approximately $41,490.00 for duty and practice ammunition.

Questions and Answers

Richard Powell: I'm going to abstain for this but we do have another representative with our office here that can address any questions that may come up.

Tom Stolz: Is this the same person who gave us our last bid on ammunition? Is this consistent? Or is it a different vendor?

Jack Regehr: In this case, there’s three vendors. Last time it was Accuracy Inc, dba Ultramax Ammunition and Armscor Cartridge Inc.

Tom Stolz: Since we're going to the new vendors for this bid is there any concern from the Sheriff's Office on quality of product? Or you solid with this bid?

Tim Myers: I'm solid with this bid.




