
3.  SHERIFF'S OFFICE AMMUNITION -- SHERIFF'S OFFICE
     FUNDING -- SHERIFF'S OFFICE
     (Request sent to 14 vendors)

     RFB #21-0011

Duty Ammunition Estimated Usage Price Per Stated Estimated Usage

1. Speer LE 9mm Luger+P 124 Gr. GDHP 12,000 rounds every 2 years No Bid
2. Hornady TAP .223 REM 53 gr GMX TAP PATROL 2 years 8,000 rounds every 2 years No Bid
3. Winchester Ranger Segmented Rifled Slug RA12RS15S 3,000 rounds per year No Bid
4. Federal Premium LE 9 pellet 00Buck flight control 4,000 rounds per year No Bid

Practice Ammunition Estimated Usage Price Per Stated Estimated Usage

5. 9mm 124 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass (AC 9-4N) 175,000 rounds per year $44,000.00
6. .223 55 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass (AC 223-1N) 65,000 rounds per year $23,000.00
7. 12 Gauge #6, 7 ½, or 8 Bird Shot 2 3/4" (50135) 9,000 rounds per year $3,250.00
Estimated Delivery Time

Duty Ammunition Estimated Usage Price Per Stated Estimated Usage

1. Speer LE 9mm Luger+P 124 Gr. GDHP 12,000 rounds every 2 years $4,315.61
2. Hornady TAP .223 REM 53 gr GMX TAP PATROL 2 years 8,000 rounds every 2 years No Bid
3. Winchester Ranger Segmented Rifled Slug RA12RS15S 3,000 rounds per year No Bid
4. Federal Premium LE 9 pellet 00Buck flight control 4,000 rounds per year $2,389.27

Practice Ammunition Estimated Usage Price Per Stated Estimated Usage

5. 9mm 124 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass 175,000 rounds per year $36,739.94
6. .223 55 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass 65,000 rounds per year $26,835.29
7. 12 Gauge #6, 7 ½, or 8 Bird Shot 2 3/4" 9,000 rounds per year $2,702.48
Estimated Delivery Time

Duty Ammunition Estimated Usage Price Per Stated Estimated Usage

1. Speer LE 9mm Luger+P 124 Gr. GDHP (Winchester RA9BA) 12,000 rounds every 2 years $0.355/round                                                                    
$4,260.00   

2. Hornady TAP .223 REM 53 gr GMX TAP PATROL 2 years (55GR 
Winchester RA223BSTAY) 8,000 rounds every 2 years $0.699/round                                                               

$5,592.00

3. Winchester Ranger Segmented Rifled Slug RA12RS15S 3,000 rounds per year $0.57/round                                             
$1,710.00

4. Federal Premium LE 9 pellet 00Buck flight control (Winchester 
RA12005) 4,000 rounds per year $0.47/round                                                    

$1880.00

Practice Ammunition Estimated Usage Price Per Stated Estimated Usage

5. 9mm 124 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass (USA9MM) 175,000 rounds per year $0.194/round                                                       
$33,950.00

6. .223 55 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass (USA 223 RIKY) 65,000 rounds per year $0.339/round                                     
$22,035.00

7. 12 Gauge #6, 7 ½, or 8 Bird Shot 2 3/4" (TRGT127) 9,000 rounds per year $0.25/round                                      
$2,250.00

Estimated Delivery Time

No Bid Kiesler Police Supply The Hunting Shack

6-12 Months/Normally 3-4 Months
Precision Delta

Items 1,2,and 6 (60-90 Days)                                                          
Items 3,4,5 and 7 (120-180) Days

BID OPENING MARCH 16, 2021

Armscor Cartridge Inc. dba ACI

30 Days
G T Distributors, Inc.
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